



County of Hawaii
Tabulation Report IFB #4567 - HEAVY EQUIPMENT FOR DPW HIGHWAYS
Vendor: CUTTER FORD INC

Code	Name	Item Description	Requested Brand	Alternative Brand	Item Vendor Reference #	Unit Price	Qty.	Unit	Total Price	Notes	Attachments
1	SIX PASSENGER DUMP TRUCK WITH LIFT GATE	Complete as Specified		FORD F350		\$129,828.11	1	each	\$129,828.11	EQUIPMENT ADDITION PROPRIETARY INFORMATION WILL BE PROVIDED TO THE END USER DIRECTLY	
2	SMALL GRADER	Complete as Specified				\$0.00	1	each	\$0.00	NO BID	
3	DINGO SKID STEER	Complete as Specified				\$0.00	3	each	\$0.00	NO BID	
4	SMALL RUBBISH TRUCK	Complete as Specified				\$0.00	1	each	\$0.00	NO BID	
5	4X4 WATER TANK TRUCK	Complete as Specified				\$0.00	2	each	\$0.00	NO BID	
6	STREET VACUUM SWEEPER	Complete as Specified				\$0.00	1	each	\$0.00	NO BID	
TOTAL									\$129,828.11		

General Comments:**General Attachments:**

1-F350CH-CVT IFB4567 DUMPBDY.pdf
2-IFB4567
F350DBMBDYFord-Dump-Body-Literature_201912.pdf
+IFB 4567 CUTTER FORD INC OFFERING.pdf



County of Hawaii
Tabulation Report IFB #4567 - HEAVY EQUIPMENT FOR DPW HIGHWAYS
Vendor: International Trucks of Hawaii, LLC

Code	Name	Item Description	Requested Brand	Alternative Brand	Item Vendor Reference #	Unit Price	Qty.	Unit	Total Price	Notes	Attachments
1	SIX PASSENGER DUMP TRUCK WITH LIFT GATE	Complete as Specified		International CV		\$156,509.54	1	each	\$156,509.54	If you have any questions please contact Taylor Waltrip at 808-348-8202 or taylor.waltrip@intl-hi.com	SUB 4x4 Dump.pdf
4	SMALL RUBBISH TRUCK	Complete as Specified		Curbtender Quantum		\$217,106.76	1	each	\$217,106.76	If you have any questions please contact Taylor Waltrip at 808-348-8202 or taylor.waltrip@intl-hi.com	SUB Small Rubbish Truck.pdf
6	STREET VACUUM SWEEPER	Complete as Specified		Elgin Regen X Sweeper		\$385,051.15	1	each	\$385,051.15	If you have any questions please contact Taylor Waltrip at 808-348-8202 or taylor.waltrip@intl-hi.com	SUB Sweeper.pdf
TOTAL									\$758,667.45		

General Comments: If you have any questions please contact Taylor Waltrip at 808-348-8202 or taylor.waltrip@intl-hi.com

General Attachments: SUB IFB 4567 HEAVY EQUIPMENT FOR DPW HIGHWAYS Notice to Bidders, Specs - Special Provisions.pdf



County of Hawaii
Tabulation Report IFB #4567 - HEAVY EQUIPMENT FOR DPW HIGHWAYS
Vendor: Inter Pacific Motors Inc

Code	Name	Item Description	Requested Brand	Alternative Brand	Item Vendor Reference #	Unit Price	Qty.	Unit	Total Price	Notes	Attachments
1	SIX PASSENGER DUMP TRUCK WITH LIFT GATE	Complete as Specified				\$124,951.78	1	each	\$124,951.78	2024 FORD F350 (W3H)	
2	SMALL GRADER	Complete as Specified				\$0.00	1	each	\$0.00	NO BID	
3	DINGO SKID STEER	Complete as Specified				\$0.00	3	each	\$0.00	NO BID	
4	SMALL RUBBISH TRUCK	Complete as Specified				\$0.00	1	each	\$0.00	NO BID	
5	4X4 WATER TANK TRUCK	Complete as Specified				\$0.00	2	each	\$0.00	NO BID	
6	STREET VACUUM SWEEPER	Complete as Specified				\$0.00	1	each	\$0.00	NO BID	
TOTAL									\$124,951.78		

General Comments:

General Attachments: 1 W3H.pdf
4567.pdf



County of Hawaii
Tabulation Report IFB #4567 - HEAVY EQUIPMENT FOR DPW HIGHWAYS
Vendor: Allied Machinery Corporation

Code	Name	Item Description	Requested Brand	Alternative Brand	Item Vendor Reference #	Unit Price	Qty.	Unit	Total Price	Notes	Attachments
2	SMALL GRADER	Complete as Specified		Leeboy 685D	IFB4567	\$227,287.86	1	each	\$227,287.86	In Stock, Available ASAP	LeeBoy_Motor-Grader_685D-Specifications_SS-2001.5-EN_2022.docx
TOTAL									\$227,287.86		

General Comments: Unit is available and in stock in Hilo

General Attachments: LeeBoy_Motor-Grader_685D-Specifications_SS-2001.5-EN_2022.docx



County of Hawaii
Tabulation Report IFB #4567 - HEAVY EQUIPMENT FOR DPW HIGHWAYS
Vendor: Service Rentals and Supplies

Code	Name	Item Description	Requested Brand	Alternative Brand	Item Vendor Reference #	Unit Price	Qty.	Unit	Total Price	Notes	Attachments
3	DINGO SKID STEER	Complete as Specified		Wacker Neuson SM 100		\$47,272.63	3	each	\$141,817.89	All attachments, training, tax and shipping /handle are rolled in each unit price.	bid 4567 wacker sm100 041724.pdf PI Sheet SM100 (1).pdf specifications SM100 041724.pdf Warranties.pdf
TOTAL									\$141,817.89		

General Comments:

General Attachments:



County of Hawaii
Tabulation Report IFB #4567 - HEAVY EQUIPMENT FOR DPW HIGHWAYS
Vendor: Kenworth Hawaii, LLC

Code	Name	Item Description	Requested Brand	Alternative Brand	Item Vendor Reference #	Unit Price	Qty.	Unit	Total Price	Notes	Attachments
5	4X4 WATER TANK TRUCK	Complete as Specified		Kenworth		\$395,956.13	2	each	\$791,912.26	Meet or Exceed all Specifications. Complete Itemized Vehicle Specification available upon request.	2024-TX-12-Pro-Spec-Sheet-Final-v2-Digital-HiRes.pdf PACCAR PX-9 Engine Brochure.pdf T380V T480V.pdf WATERTRUCKS.pdf
6	STREET VACUUM SWEEPER	Complete as Specified		Kenworth		\$473,624.72	1	each	\$473,624.72	Meet or Exceed all Specifications. Complete Itemized Vehicle Specification available upon request.	Allison 3500 Series.pdf Nescon_Brochure.pdf PACCAR PX-9 Engine Brochure.pdf T380 T480.pdf
TOTAL									\$1,265,536.98		

General Comments:

General Attachments: Bidder Checklist - Signature Page.pdf
IFB4567- DPW Highways Doc.pdf